AT Fo Elo TA0-33004/99 REGD. NO. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of FIundia

EXTRAORDINARY
9T III—avus 4
PART III—Section 4

YRR & WehRTioTa
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

9. 371] =2 feoett, gorar, faamr 20, 2017/91g 29, 1939
No. 371] NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 20, 2017/ BHADRA 29, 1939

Hgor ¥ afw R
T
e, 1 A, 2017

ET.E . T AT 9444 — ST F0T ( STHHAT 7 3ol e siqer ) srfafRaw 1970 (1970 =+ 5) F a1
19 #F¥ ITYRT (2) F T (TF) FIT T JARAT AT TN T U HA 9F A (AT F (A9 Hed Ay g 5%
& AT TRTHT Fh ST Few TEHIE hT TF WOl &, Heo § i a1 (FH=1ET) Jor= fafaaw 1995 # werre ¢
g et fEfeee a9mar g, s -
1. ()7 fAffaw dea §F e SRar (FE=) Yo (Fenee) &feaw 2017 wgemr |
(2)=7 FAfA=T # st TOeqaT ITs F GIEHT, T TLHTLT TSI | I THAT Al T F A0 Z0 |
2. Heo 99 oA SeaT (FHar) T faf=aw, 1995 # (39 a12 #ig T fafaawi % =7 # 92féq), -Ffaaw 2, %
T (uH) ¥ SEe () F are Feitra 3T g et A, set-
() W< 2005 F T @ a7 I I8 AT H T gU HATHGT AT o 219 TLHAT FHALL & dael |, 5% H
FOT T F fUser a9 wEHl F S #HAT g7 agha, Fe a9w gty aRe gw aaw, afy w8 e
T 3aw, |TaH I, SATEETHE AT J4q, FEa w0E 9w a9 iy Tew i e 399, 71
FE 2,

T 01 7S 2005 & YATAT TH G & YT | 759 1998 F 727 faaw 9T 77 39 a1g offhe 30 3r9e1 2005
T g I9T § qATHET AT o g1 ST arel foheft F9=18 o dag § g9re 729

3. 3w fafaeat % faffaw 3 % oo - faffew (4) %, Refefea se-fEfhem Fr sfeenfa B s, suta-

“(4) (%) srtergra fafer 3 a7 =% 31 99 2010 7 37 ST T S 1 94T | Fared gl
(@) 37 - faffaw 10 = =z, Fwlerfea sy-Bfa=at w5 afeatera fRET SrEEm, s -

5792 GI/2017 1)



THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

(1) <1 &% F¥ a7 § 29 fqvaw 1995 F Tger 4 ¥ 27 1 2010 TF 9% i a1 H Fawd 2 &,
Ford T3 U FH=TT (e § Reffea srasaaarsti w1 @ i aqt F1 9o #4d &,

(12) STt = it Fa7 | 29 fFaraw 1995 § wger o 47 39 fAfY & $fiw 27 ¥ 2010 T Uger qari=e=T
g gt a9rd & U8 = Aaem § gt sraeaaarsdt 1 927 ofiT oat &1 aTa" &3 2

(13) ST & it = § 29 e 1995 F Tger ¥ 7 39 f4fY % a1e F=riagw g i qeg 27 % &,
o wmaar ¥ sEr fF g ARt F et aonfRuafa, s ot & Tow a7 % afiEre dom F
TR &I, AT g &1 Tare Aaem § Feifed srasasrare w1 1@ 3T aat T 97 Fdrar,

(14) ST S Y T # 29 e 1995 & Tzt o,377 3q A F arg &= 6 Jar § wa gu geg a1 1
2, UH wrael ® ST 3 29 fAfReat & sefie gonteat, s afiare £ dom 71 39+ aiEr, doe &
THATL &1, IS g o1 TRare e § [Hetfa smasasharst &1 q=7 3T oat 1 qTed FdT 2,

<% Attt % fAfaaa 28 o, yragmt % 9re, et sraen afeatera fhu ST, st -

"ui T |1 T FEET ST FaArtag Ry T S 9T e ¥ uge s qar=g T & wreor 29 e 1995 #ir
AT 39 FT% HaAT H A2t o, ATRT 15 99 i A8 FaAT F SUCT I Gy § AISET JATE FT TS AT 5
ATATY TF FLHT FIT AT, AT § Ifeafea [t ofw oat & Aqurad & arefia 9o wg § o gra
& e g |

I fafeat % At 36 #, -

(F) @< () & Fmterra sraeam enfae G s, s -

"Tiq 1 WS 2005 F, AT QAT FHATL 6 STATAT [hel FHATRT % G § AT 1 3757 1998 Fl, AT 39F

THETT, T3q 31 sTFza¥ 2002 & Tgel HATAT gU,IARN qAqH G9F UF g 1S FAF TAHTG 3T SFHTTF
FHATY & Gag H ST 1 797 1998 1, AT IqF 18, HATHIT g0 UF (Agre IqaaATT 919 ATl SF9raRTierT

FHAT KT A |7 T9ud €07 qiA9Tg, YT AT T AT ST FHET it qr §7 A" w9
giaaTgaaT i JTATE AATHATT I AT SFRTIOTR FHATL i T | T\ w97 TTAHTE gHft |

(@) @< (1) F are Aefoiaa @< () artaer BT srem, st ;-

(3Y) sterpTierd FHATE & TATAT et FHAT & oy § Sff 1 72 2005 7, 7 IHF 918 AT
T ITHI UF g AT |1 G 19 F07 TiAwTe o7 steratiors 0=t & daer § S 1 75 2005 ¥, a1
ITF FTT HATHIT g0 UF [AgTs JqqHTT T AT SRR HHATL T A< |1 STEHT &0 T(AATE,

AT ATTATT T AT SFSTHTIorR FHATL A T1d |7 S| &9 T\ T21 T FA1e Ja=9m9 I
AT STSTRTor HHATL T Ueh goIT¥ SIEHT 7T TAATE BT |

i 1 72 2005 F 7o 35| 7, 39 @ & TEL serehTiors Fa=T<r digd et off Fd=rd a2 any
ZILST 1 qaw=T 2002 FT AT I8F 18 AT 30 378 2005 FT AT IHY T8 HATAET gU |

(2) Sershriord FHATET & srerar Rl =T & dayg § S 99w=2007 6Ig & I f3a9 #71, av
ITF AT HATHET gU IAHT UF 1Y |1q & IATH ¥ YIAHTE M7 storaprferd FH=T % dae §
ST A9 2007 ATE & T4 @9 &1, 77 39 978 qaTagd gv UF fAgre aaaard aTe arel sierriors
FHATT T 0= " TS T TR, AT TATHE I AT ST FHAT AT AT @1 ar
&0 TTAATE qAT A ATATE TAAHT T AT SHTRTIorh FHATL hl Teh goITE d1 |T Iearierd &9
gtaHTE ERM |




[ar [II-@vE 4]

A T TSYS : STHTERIT 3

(iii)

<% fateat & Afaaa 40 % sy-fafeag (4) 9 -
T (U) #, 37-gz (1) F a1, Fetiag Jreaym ud @ anfier B s, srata-:

qiq g T 72 2005 F wuw faaw u¥ i ¥, @Rt % =9 sv-ds # y9TEr A9t oqeai “gg g
TTT &1 I &l 9158 “HTT g1 A ATfere” & giaearaa forar w2 |

(iv) 19 2005 & 4T 38F dT% YATAGT AT GAKHATAT F TG § el AT g€ T | T3 €70
i W, T st e wr

(v) 1 FaF=T 2007 &1 AT ITF 918 qAT=GT AT Jq FHATRAT 6 G4 § el TG I A AT
FOIF U0 IS WIE, TAT STieTat ofiv Fremd & ford;
gT () ®, 37-w< (i) F are, Fatiag = ve g onfier g s, erta-

Tiq 77 % #E 2005 F wuw faaw o i ¥, @A F =9 3v-gT # qATEr SHtE qeai “gg g
TTT T oI Fl 9158 “HTT g1 A ATfere” & giaeerag forar w2 |

(iv) 1 £ 2005 FT AT IHF FT8 HATHET AT Gd FHATAT F dae § Fadd 47 gorTe 1= | §693 €00
ot aTe, A st i Fre o

(v) 1 Faw& 2007 T 7 IHF A8 FATAGT T Gq FHATAT % Hael § Fae FTg g A5 aqv
FoId 0 IS WIE, TAT STIeaTat ofiv Frem & ford;
gT (9 ¥, 378z (jii) F are, et s ua 9@ artae e s, sei-

qiq 7 % 72 2005 F wow feaw w2 o7 ¥, FfFai F =o su-ge § warEt s & asst ‘| g
A AT e F orex ‘A g i |47 h\” 7 whaeaig BT g

(iv) 1< 2005 T AT ITF FT% YATHET T Gd FHATAT 6 G H Ao A gT< 19 &t A’
FIU TS /g, IIAT ATTHRTRAT S FTHAT 6 o,

(v) 1 Fa¥=aT 2007 T T I8F A1 HATAGT T G FHATLAT & G4 § Fae qi= gore 41 9T Tgred
FIU TS WTE, JIAT ATTHRTRAT S FTHAT 6 o,

7. 3 fataast & fafaw 48 o, fefortea ffew v stoearfa BT so, seta-

“48. 31 7 78 AP ZTR A -

(1) =f3 Joaartt ot Far it st F o B a9 =ntE seEEr 8§ 97 weEr ar

FATILATRT AT AT T AT SATAATST AT FASTT F1F FHT IMYT TIAT ST & AT TEAT ISR
TOTT AT ITRT AT T THhdT & AT AENT ¥ T T &, ATy TATHT &7 & 77 [Ferifea st & o, i
o A1 ge Tt T ofeia g1 % O A7 ofer F7 o § 99 FIA F A9 T AT g |

i wre o) sfam swaer ST A % g A F wargel T S

TR gl TUF 3 U 39T U AT AT § AT g Ay A g, Semantt grer g due i @
= Aot & 9gq 37 Fan o § FH TE g

wig 7 oft B =T i Farthgtr & Targ, Ganfe s, 3 sierh i f@r § w9 gu

Aw At T g, =4 ATt F srehie wrdargr awsf st qaur s g ag aw i S of a8
FHT TR & AT T SRR AT T & St /e S far § Y




4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

(2) =fz FA=TE F Jar & = gu Fanfia wrdard) g 785 6w of, 1 18 "qerrm F [ ad @
ge Tft oft =rear & wraer ® #rS it wrtearet s 98 i saeft
T TH T AT T TS AqATAAF FHATR!, FHATL il HAT TATY 6 T SAATH AT FIAATGT 5
forr AT wiera & STgETT g |

(3) Stgt Terd yTfaehrdT Tor & anfefw grfer it aget #1 a3er a1 g 98l aget aradr #HEET B
Farfagfer i 9 w1 TwE Yo F U fagrs T oftes 6 2% a7 T8 qEn

8. 3 fafa=wt & fafaaw 52 #:-
(@) 3-faffme (1) % forg, Fefef sufafes sfenta B s, st -
“(1) TRt =Y % gy § srgt A==y 34 a7 f3fRaw 46 F ey o) 2 8, 7har it o & Serar uh
Tord I AT F < gi, o uw e qErtee grar g1
() sw-fafeam (3) & 71 sraen=r v enforer o s -
“qiq 27 A9 2010 FT AT IHF ATE S HHATL FF TTSAT H AT SIT ATel T TR Ford dfga dor 27

FaEY 2009 | AT FHIT 1
9. 3 faffem & wivfore ||, el Gt s fBer s, st -
TR 1l
(Rfaer 37 3)

T Ter u¥ ggaTs Tgd Asferfed sqam gt -
(1) srefieeer 2oft & ST FH=TEY, 01 Say 1986 &1 AT 39 THTd, T8q 01 qda% 1992 % q4 Fari+a< gu ¥, =0
srfgrawrt Aol & S FHATE 01 St 1986 &1 AT I8F TATT 93 01 [T 1993 F I qarfag< gu 4, %
A |, HETE 99T @t 1960=100 # st wraemet & o sifeer T | ST god gais

& faurer sfea & 600 sl % Fuw, TATRAMT 4 =i i gfg T T g a1 v+ feae o age a9
BT | UH T 4 31 61 9eTs Tgd | g a1 frae = 77 7 srqame ot $ir st

T Fo T Aq- 9 CGRLEERICHCE RS k)
wfawTg WS Tga M W
(1) 2
(i) %. 1250/- T 0.67 wfdrera
(i) = 1251/- & %.2000/- %. 1250/~ T 0.67 wiaerd 9T + % 1250/- T e qof
a7 0.55 widera
(i)  =.2001/- to ®.2130/- %. 1250/- *1 0.67 ¥i@ea qam + % 2000/- 3%
%. 1250/- % = % ¥ &1 0.55 wirera T2 %. 2000/-
¥ oTfar g Tor &1 0.33 wierd |
(iv) %2130/- 5 =fars % 1250/- FT 0.67 wirerd a4T + ¥ 2000/- 3i¥ . 1250/-

F = % oia< #71 0.55 yidera 97 + 5. 2130/- i< =.
2000/- % o= F ¥ F7 0.33 gfaera a7 + %. 2130/- ¥
rterss gof g 1 0.17 i |



[ar [II-@vE 4] HIRA bl TSTUA ¢ STHIERYT 5

(2) FrETTE Zoft 3 ST FHATEY 01 FFaT 1992 7 AT 39+ TATT HaATAT gU g qaT AfAFHr<r 2oft & S F=mdr
01 @TE 1993 FT IT SHF THTT JATGT U &, F ATHS #H, A AT H@ar 1960=100 & si=ifr®
FIRML & fordr srfeer At Slied STHhT god ga&i® & [aarar sied & 1148 it & FH9¥, TATRA,

T 4 IR T ghg T I TR qAT TAF e 9% FEt AT T | U TAF 4 ek fT 7S Tgd H
g 77 Ferae = &7 T e oo it STt

S G99 T @ 999 & yRaa F € TH
RERRICRITKIT T Tga F W
(1) ()
) %. 2400/- T 0.35 wfdrera
(i) %. 2401/- ¥%.3850/- %. 2400/- %7 0.35 wfdera q=T + %. 2400/- &
srfere ger Hor 1 0.29 wiaerd |
(i) ®. 3851/- ¥%.4100/- %.2400/- T 0.35 Tfaoraa«r + %.3850/- ¥

%, 2400/- % €= % (a1 0.29 wfaer + %. 3850 H (4w
e TorT &1 0.17 faerd |

(iv) =.4100/- & =fers %. 2400/- #T1 0.35 wWiderd aaT + %. 3850/- 3T %.

2400/- F €= F Fa¥ F1 0.29 wiaera qur + 5. 4100/-
3T %. 3850/- F = F [a¥ FT1 0.17 Tfaera qoum + =.
4100/- 5 TFer qa1 Tor %7 0.09 wiqera |

(3) ST FEETT 1 A9 1998 T AT IHF THTT TG g0 8 Sve HeTe Ted J@T 1960=100 &
FATRIE AT o o el A1 e STHIh Jod gahish & [qHTel oiad § 1616 7 sfars
TAE 4 3t i, FamfRarta, weirsw gta F orr 33 gl qur yord fwreae 3 o aeEt 7T grft | T
TAF 4 St Y wEaTs red ® i A1 ferae = 3 @ sqE afaw e fi e -

T G T 4 a9 % g FsTH
AT YA HEATS, Tgd Hit T
(1) )
0 %. 3380/- a% 0.25 wfaera
(ii) %. 3381/- & %.5420/- %.3380/- FT 0.25 Tiaera =T + %.3380/- &

arfers o g 1 0.21 Fiaerd |
(iii) %. 5421/- T%.5770/- %.3380/- T 0.35 Tiaeraqar + %.5420/- ¥

%. 3380/- = = % i< #T1 0.21 Afqerd + ©.5420 # (ferF
A T FT 0.12 Tia9rd |

(iv) =.5770/- & wfers % 3380/- #1 0.25 wiaad a=m + % 5420/- T
%. 3380/- & == % a1 0.21 wiaera =1 + £.5770/-
AT % 5420/- F f= F Fd< Fw 0.12 wiyera qam +
%, 5770/- ¥ srterss gt o %7 0.06 Fiererd |




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

g, 1 7% 2005 9% AT F FHATRAT F Taef § ST 1 375 1998 & AT ITF THTT Ao 31 e 2002
FT AT ITY Tgd HATHIT gU & Ive HeTs Wgd H@ar 1960=100 & s=itfis wrawmd & fordr srfere
AT S STHHT o AR 6 [AHTer e § 1684  IfarT wois 4 sl fif, Farfeata, s
g % forr 37 grft Tam yers Rieree & forg aeeEt 9 grft | T8 v 4 st it 981 Ted o 9is
77 firerere f=r faa 1 st g e i Sttt -

®)

o G4 T 999 & yRaa F € TH
ATyt HEATE, T Hit
(M (2
) %. 3550/- a&® 0.24 wfdera
(i) %. 3551/- & %.5660/- %.3550/- T 0.24 yfaera a1 + £.3550/- &
arfers o g 1 0.20 ierd |
(i) % 5651/- ¥ %.6010/- %.3550/- T 0.24 FTaoraaer + %.5650/- i<

%. 3550/- % i & (< #71 0.20 gfaerd + €.5650 7 1T+
e Tor &1 0.12 wfaerd |

(iv)  %.6010/- & srfers % 3550/- ®1 0.24 gfaad T=m + % 5650/- T
%. 3550/- % = o i< &1 0.20 Tiaera a9r + %.6010/-
AT % 5650/- F f F FdAT Fw 0.12 wiyera qam +
%. 6010/- ¥ srferss ot o %7 0.06 Fierer |

1 7€ 2005 T IT IEF THTT JAT(G FHATRAT F el |, TEITE T2d J@«r 1960=100 # sr=ifis
FRMRL & o arfer Wi sied SUFTH g s & [JdHTel ofted § 2288 ¥ afas T+
4 st &, FartRata, woas gty F o 37 grft @ yas femae F ol agelt an grft | o
THF 4 Sl F o HeaTs e § UHT gl AT fieree g7 gaq # 0.18 wiaerd it 3T & o i
ST

g 1 9% 2005 U¥ AT §, FHATRAT % dag § Sr 01 Faw¥ 2002 FT AT 396 a1 At 30 e

2005 T IT IHH Tgo HATGT gU &, HaIls Uad 6 @S il al & AL o gt

g 1 q9E< 2007 FT AT ITF THTT HATAGT FHATAT 6 Gl §,HMS Tgd Ja«dr 1960=100 &
AR FTRTRT % ford srferer Wi S| SR go gt & faaral e § 2836 & s1fars
T 4 st A, Farteafa, weaw gfg F o 3 grlt aur wow Riee & o aget am goft
ITATRT AT 4 3kl & o wewms wga & UHr iy a1 Rierae qo o= i1 0.15 widea fr sx &

wfeawfera &t srasft-

LTS T fUse a9 & rea, a7 Y (o F wgi|l § THfd gasit & fqarar sed 1
TEell FEAKT T AT AT 31 TS FT TATH S AT ZATRT 6 o T 36 9 o, 7 v @ &
AEIAT H THTIOT GAhiahl & (AHTST a9 3T 01 SWTEd & LS AT 31 AT & THTH g ATt
FATET & o T grm |

TfaTT 9o, STerhaT Yo ST STAEEIT W & "o § WEATS Ugd FUT Iredi@d I & AqHT F
M |

O o G T¥ HEITS ALY T STqAtar Serefiaweor & arg off < Sty |

TS TTEd STy To 72 37 781 ¢ |



[ar [II-@vE 4] HIRA bl TSTUA ¢ STHIERYT 7

(9) e For ARt &1 ger Ford ~gaaw To9 F 7 g T qoT G AT STk Gore T

TRIATH T9F | AT &, T8 IATH G99 T2 AN HgITs Tgd AG T FT TR |
10. Iy fafamt & wifore |1l % fory fRertertera afvfore sfaeerfoa o srosm, srafa-

“qffre Il
(faffaw 39 3)
TiETE T T ATLTT ¥ T9 TR g -
(F) FHATTAT o WIS §,SHTRTIorH FHATAT T GIEH, Mgt FHATL HIEIATE A0 F A7 T 01 Fawa<

1992 & & AT AT AT AT Tl FHAT ATAFET a7t & o7 3 01 TS 1993 F qd FATHaT

T 4T
ERREIERIGEIFS AT qiETe Tom it wfer
(1) (2)
%. 1500/- T% T T 30 TTA9 qeT THETT Ford qT (+) 9=t &1 30 wierd,

et ot Wiy fAfer § steram & oy &t STt 8 v wEaTe
a7 & fora 9, sfafte e 9e| g | ge qur At
TfaTe For T T €. 375/- WiawTg & 7 T AT |
%. 1501 ¥ %.3000 FAT F 20 TITT T TRATT T TAT (+) 91 w1 20 Fiaerd,
St st iy fAfer § sforam % o it STt § o wEe
a & fora 7, sfat aive Tom grft | ge qur sfaies
TRETT Gor & TN €. 450/- TTAHTg & FH7 q51 [T |
%.30009 e+ Fa T 15 TTA9H T TETT T TAT (+) 9t w1 15 widerd,
St ot Wiy fAfer § steram & oy &t STt 8w wEaTe
o & fora 9, sfafe e 9| gt | ge qur e
afaTe Ter &1 TR €. 600/- SfaHTg & F7 2T %. 1250/- Tfaarg
T arfers 7 R |
(@) FHATAT % ATHA H, AT FHATAT FT GIEHT, Tl FHAT FIEML 0T F 97 ¥ 01 qJav7a7
1992 FT IT IHF THTT AT gl AT AT STt FHATL ATAFTLY & | AT 3w 01 AT 1993 FT AT

IHF THTT JATIAGT o o7 -

ERREIERIGEIFS AT giETe Tom it wfer
(1) (2)

%.2870 T% Faw 1 30 TITed T TRETT T TAT (+) 91 w1 30 wiaerd,
St st iy fAfer § sforam & o it STt § o wETe
T & fora 9, sfafees e 9| gt | ge qur At
TRETT Gor & TN €. 720/- TAHTg & FH7 q51 ST |

%.2871 9 %.5740 Fa T 20 TTAH T THETT T TAT (+) 9=t w1 20 widerd,
St T Wiy fAfer § steram & oy &t STt 8 w g wEaTe
o & fora 9, sfaftes e 9| gl | ge qur e
TfETe For T T €. 860/- TTAHTg & FW7 AT AT |




THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

%.5740% =rfa®

FAT T 15 TIAH T TATT T TAT (+) 9t w1 15 wiqerd,
ey o wiasy fAfar & storar & o it STt & o wE
a & fora 7, sfates afvee T gt | ge qur afaies
afiae T # A & 1150/- WaHTE ¥ 9 9T % 2400/-
stawTe & sfass 72t g |

(1) 01 3T 1998 T AT IHH THTA HATIHGT B AT STLTHTIor FHATHAT Fl
FIZHT FUATAT (TTAFTE TAT FTHI L) 6 ATHA H -

FaHT gfaaTg
(1)

[T i o i Trfer
2)

%. 4040 %

%.4041% %.8080

%.8080 ¥ Tfar=

Faw 1 30 TITed T TETT T9F TAT (+) 91 w1 30 wiaerd,
St ot Wiy fAfer § steram & oy &t STt 8§ w g wEaTe
a & fora 7, sfate aiveme Tom grft | ge qur afaies
TRaTe Gord & TR €. 1015/- IFAwTg & F7 951 M1 |
FA T 20 TTAH T TATT T TAT (+) 9t w1 20 widerd,
St ot wiaey fAfer § steram & o &t STt 8§ wig wEaTe
o & fora 9, sfafe e gem gl | ge qur A
TfETT Ford T T €. 1212/- IFAwTg & F7 981 AT |
AT F 15 TITT T TETE T9F TAT (+) 91 w1 15 Fiqerd,
St ot iy fAfer § sforam % o it STt § o wEe
a7 & fora 9, sfafees e 9e| gl | ge qur e
afa™ To| # AW % 1616/- WAaATE ¥ FH 4T %, 3378/-
wfawTg & arfars & g |

i, 01 WS 2005 ¥, sieratiers FHATAT FT BISHT, FHATAT (ATAFTE TAT FTHMR TT) F ATHA
H ST 01 o1 1998 T AT ITF TATT T¢q 31 sFa< 2002 FT AT I9H 3 FATHGT g I, TaTT

Tt ¥ ATLTIOT T TH THL gl
AT yfaarg arfRre ateare goa $ir wfer
(1) )
%4210 9% Faa w1 30 Yiaed g TE Fo| 9T (+) |99t #7130

%4211 9% 8420

sferera, et ot wiass [fer & stora= & forr &t STt
T wiq e a * forr 7, afafiss afare tom gnft
qor q97 Afafts gfaw do &1 a8 €. 1056/- =IFdH
TfwTE SR |

Faa AT 20 TA9 g7 TRE ForF AT (+) A<t w1 20
sferera, SRt ot wiasy ffer & stora= & forr &t STt
& i WS W ¥ o A, sl wiET dor el |
qor q97 Afats gfaw do #71 a8 % 1262/- 7w
THwTE SR |



[ar [II-@vE 4] HIRA bl TSTUA ¢ STHIERYT

%.8420 ¥ wfa= AT HwT 15 TA9s g1 TREw FoF AT (+) 99t w1 15
staera, ST ot wfeey [fer & sferam & fordr &t st
& i wETE W ¥ o A, sl wiET dor 2l |
qor q97 Afafts gfaw do9 #71 a8 €. 1687/- =Idw
wfaATE T9T sTfaay %, 3521/- SfawTeg g |

01 @< 2005 T AT IHF TETT FATATT 21 AT STTFRTIorF FHATAT F ZIZHT FHATALT

(=)
(TErRTET T FTHATTE 2T) o Haer §:-

FIFHET TFaATE AT qiETe For it wafer
(1) 2)

%.5720q% Far &1 30 TfTas gof iETe Ford g (+) 9=t &1 30 viaerd,
et o wfasy a7 steram & forg &t STt € g wEe
a & o wgl, sfafis afaw dom geft | 9@ qur sfafes
TfaTe $ord 7 T €. 1435/- =AdH TIAHTE ST |

%.57219%.11440 A & 20 FfTaa qof TET Gord qor (+) 9= &1 20 viaer,
St orT wfasy a7 steram & forg &t STt € wiq wEe
T & o agl, sfafw afam dom goft | @ qor afafew
TfeaTe Gerd & AT %, 1715/~ =qATH T(AATE T |

%.11440 =rferw A & 15 Ffaaa qo 7ER Gord qor (+) 9= &1 15 viaer,
St orT wiasy e 7 sterame & oy &t STt § T wee
T & o =€), sfafw ufaw dom goft | @ qor afafew
TRE T F AN %, 2292/- AR ITdATE q9qT AtHaH %
4784/ wfaHTg FHIT |
g, 01 WE 2005 &, ST HHATAL H GISHT, FHATAT (TTTHET TIT FIAEIAL 1) F
AT | ST 01 FaFaT 2002 T AT IHqF THTT 7q 30 o14er 2005 7 AT I [F HAT=g g0 7,
TfeaTe Gor T AT T TH GT F AR AH g -
()01 W 2007 T IT SHH TETT HATIAGT gI ATel FLHTIOTR FHATIT T GIEhe FHATLAT (ATAFRTE
TAT T L) o G o
feoqufy -
(1) W& 9T Afafih Thame $ord 72 37 981 g |
(2) ST AGE TFER G F TUET F TAST H Faqaard, BFfAEw 2 F 37 g (vH) '@
Fratha G qur fataaw 35 % su-fafaaw (3) it sarear # Metfa w=t &1 a9 grm
(3) sferawTiord FHATH F wTHS §, wfiam Yo ft wqmaw qur afdsmaw i, wET g
AT Faw ¥ 7T F AT F ERAT
(4) =t g1 qiETe Gor g ATaih G99 T ot TN ~qAaW GO & ¥ graT g ar TRt

FT =AqH Yo &F S0 T U =Aaw afiare Yo ¥ gEaTE Ted w1 R A S
TR, TAAH TETE G99 o ST qarT 99 qgi &f ST |




10 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

HTEATHS ATIT
Tt waTa ¥ 73U v 3w At w a9 qer ¢ Feew 7 o agwa fawt 3 oeat &
T, "qafad Swi grer fau o ey srferger F swame 9v waw gt A A7 adT 9% 99 {7 g6
% off TqT F FHTAI TAT AT ATAFTLT FHT % S geareqid ¢ | THU, TH qE % TEATI T/ F
foreft =iz % Rat w= yfager sara 78 a=vm
oY STl , WETTEEE
[ st 111/4/57T./236/17]

A gatafaaw 29.09.1995 # WarTird 37 1T ¥ 18 § AT & ToTa= o A1 |11, 9 § yerfora 4
e srfergmmTatt 3 st gentara faar w, sratq-

1. T, 25, faais 21.06.2003
2. TweT. 42, faiF 16.10.2004
3. T, 67, AT+ 21.03.2012

4.  Hear. 21, faqi4 24.05.2014

CENTRAL BANK OF INDIA
NOTIFICATION
Mumbiai, the 1st September, 2017

F.No. CO:HRD:PEN:444.- In exercise of the powers conferred by clause (f) of sub-section (2) of section 19
of the Banking Companies (Acquisition and Transfer of Undertakings) Act, 1970 ( 5 of 1970), the Board of Directors
of the Central Bank of India in consultation with the Reserve Bank of India and with the previous sanction of the
Central Government, hereby makes the following regulations further to amend the Central Bank of India (Employees’)
Pension Regulations, 1995, namely :-

1.(1) These regulations may be called the Central Bank of India(Employees’) Pension(Amendment) Regulations,
2017.

(2) Save as otherwise expressly provided in these regulations, they shall come into force on the date of their
publication in the Official Gazette.

2. In the Central Bank of India (Employees’) Pension Regulations 1995 (hereinafter referred to as the said
regulations), -

In regulation 2, in clause (s), after sub-clause(c), the following sub-clause shall be inserted, namely:-

“(d)  inrelation to an employee who retired or died while in service on or after the first day of May, 2005 the
basic pay including stagnation increments, if any, and Special pay, Graduation Pay, Professional
Qualification Pay, increment component of Fixed Personnel Pay and Officiating Pay, if any, drawn by
the employee during the last ten months of his service in the Bank:

Provided that with effect from 1% day of May, 2005 the provisions of this clause shall have effect in
relation to an employee who retired or died while in service on or after 1** day of April, 1998 but before
30" day of April, 2005”.

3. In regulation 3 of the said regulations, for sub-regulation (4), the following sub-regulation shall be substituted,
namely:-

“(4) (a) join the service of the bank on or after the notified date and on or before the 31* day of March, 2010;”.

(b) after sub-regulation (10), the following sub-regulations shall be inserted, namely:-



[ar [II-@vE 4]

A T TSYS : STHTERIT 11

“(11) were in the service of the Bank prior to the 29" September, 1995 and continue in the service of the

Bank as on the 27" April, 2010 provided such employee meets the requirement and comply with the
conditions laid down in the settlement;

(12) were in the service of the Bank prior to the 29™ September, 1995 and retired after that date andprior

to 27" April, 2010 provided such employee meets the requirements and comply with the conditions
laid down in the settlement;

(13) wherein service of the Bank, prior to the 29t September, 1995 retired after that date and had died in

which case their family shall be entitled to the pension or the family pension, as the case may be
under these regulations, if the family of the deceased meets the requirement and complies with the
conditions laid down in the settlement;

(14) were in the service of the bank prior to the 29" September, 1995 and died while in service of the Bank after

that date in which case their family shall be entitled to the pension or the family pension, as the case
may be under these regulations, if the family of the deceased meet the requirement and complies
with the conditions laid down in the settlement.”.

In regulation 28 of the said regulations, after the proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided further that employees who ceased to be in service on or after the 29" September, 1995 on account of
voluntary retirement before attaining the age of superannuation but after rendering service for a minimum
period of 15 years in accordance with the Scheme framed in this regard by the Board with the approval of the
Government, shall be entitled to join the Pension Fund, subject to the compliance of the terms and conditions
mentioned in the Scheme.”

In regulation 360f the said regulations,-

(a) inclause (c), the followingprovisoshall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that on and from the 1" day of May, 2005 the amount of minimum pension, in respect of an
employee, other than a part-time employee, who retired on or after the 1** April, 1998 but before the 31*
October, 2002 shall be rupees one thousand and sixty per month and rupees three hundred and fifty five in
respect of a part-time employee drawing 1/3 scale wages, rupees five hundred and thirty in respect of a part-
time employee drawing %2 scale wages and rupees seven hundred and ninety five in respect of a part-time
employee drawing % scale wages, where the part-time employee retired on or after 1* day of April, 1998.”;

(b) after clause (c), the following clause (d) shall be insertednamely:-

“(d)

rupees one thousand four hundred and thirty fiveper month in respect of an employee, other than a
part-time employee, where the employee retired on or after 1* day of May 2005 and rupees four
hundred and eightyper month in respect of a part-time employee drawing 1/3 scale of wages, rupees
seven hundred and twenty per month in respect of part-time employee drawing %2 scale wages and
rupees one thousand and eightyper month in respect of a part-time employee drawing % scale wages,
where the part-time employee retired on or after the 1% day of May 2005:

Provided that on and from the 1* day of May 2005 the provisions of this clause shall also apply to an
employee including a part-time employee who retired on or after 1°* November 2002 but on or
before 30" April 2005.;

(e) rupees one thousand seven hundred and seventy nine per month in respect of an employee, other than a

part-time employee, where the employee retired on or after 1* day of November 2007 and rupees
five hundred and ninety five per month in respect of a part-time employee drawing 1/3 scale of
wages, rupees eight hundred and ninety two per month in respect of part-time employee drawing %2
scale of wages and rupees one thousand three hundred and thirty nine per month in respect of a part-
time employee drawing 3% scale wages, where the part-time employee retired on or after the 1* day
of November 2007.”.



12 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

(6) In regulation 40, of the said regulations, in sub-regulation (4),-

(1) in clause (a), after sub-clause (iii),the following proviso and clause shall be inserted, namely:-

‘Provided that on and from the 1* day of May 2005 the provisions of this sub-clause shall have effect
as if for the words “six thousand seven hundred and fifty six”, the words “seven thousand and forty”,
had been substituted.;

(iv) nine thousand five hundred and sixty five rupees per mensem only in respect of employees, both
officers and workmen, who retired or died on or after 1™ day of May 2005; ’;

(v) Eleven thousand eight hundred and fifty six rupees per mensem only in respect of employees, both
officers and workmen, who retired or died on or after 1st day of November 2007.”

(ii) in clause (b), after sub-clause (iii), the following proviso and clause shall be inserted, namely:-

‘Provided that on and from the 1* day of May 2005 the provisions of this sub-clause shall have effect
as if for the words “six thousand seven hundred and fifty six”, the words “seven thousand and forty”,
had been substituted;

(iv) nine thousand five hundred and sixty five rupees per mensem only in respect of employees, both
officers and workmen, who retired or died on or after 1st day of May 2005.’;

(v) Eleven thousand eight hundred and fifty six rupees per mensem only in respect of employees, both
officers and workmen, who retired or died on or after 1st day of November 2007.

(iii) in clause (c), after sub-clause (iii), the following proviso and clause shall be inserted, namely:-

‘Provided that on and from the 1st day of May 2005 the provisions of this sub-clause shall have effect
as if for the words “three thousand three hundred and seventy eight,” the words “three thousand five
hundred and twenty,” had been substituted.;

(iv) four thousand seven hundred and eighty three rupees per mensem only in respect of employees, both
officers and workmen, who retired or died on or after 1* day of May 2005.".

(v) five thousand nine hundred and twenty eight rupees per mensem only in respect of employees, both
officers and workmen, who retired or died on or after 1st day of November 2007.

@) For regulation 48 of the said regulations, the following regulations shall be substituted, namely:-

“48. Recovery of pecuniary loss caused to Bank.-

(1) The Competent Authority may withhold or withdraw a pension or a part thereof, whether
permanently or for a specified period, and order recovery from pension of the whole or part of any
pecuniary loss caused to the Bank if in any departmental or judicial proceedings the pensioner is found
guilty of grave misconduct or negligence or criminal breach of trust or forgery or for acts done
fraudulently during the period of his service:

Provided that the Board shall be consulted before any final orders are passed:

Provided further that where a part of pension is withheld or withdrawn the amount of pension drawn by
a pensioner shall not be less than the minimum pension payable under these regulations:

Provided also that the departmental proceedings, if instituted while the employee was in service, shall,
after the retirement of the employee, be deemed to be proceedings under these regulations and shall be
continued and concluded by the authority by which they were commenced in the same manner as if the
employee had continued in service.

(2) No departmental proceedings, if not instituted while the employee was in service, shall be instituted
in respect of an event which took place more than four years before such institutions:

Provided that the disciplinary proceedings so instituted shall be in accordance with the procedure
applicable to disciplinary proceedings in relation to the employee during the period of his service.



[9r HI—@rs 4] T =hT TSTIA @ STHTHROT 13

(3)Where the Competent Authority orders recovery of pecuniary loss from the pension, the recovery
shall not ordinarily be made at a rate exceeding one-third of the pension admissible on the date of
retirement of the employee.”.

8. In regulation 52 of the said regulations,-
(a) for sub-regulation (1), the following sub-regulation shall be substituted, namely:-

“(1) Except in the case of an employee to whom the provisions of regulation 34 or regulation 46 apply, a
pension other than family pension shall become payable from the date following the date on which an
employee retires.”.

(b) in sub-regulation (3), the following proviso shall be inserted, namely:-

“Provided that pension including family pension to those who opted to join the Bank Employees’ Pension
Scheme on or after the 27" April, 2010 shall be payable with effect from the 27" November, 2009.”.

9. For Appendix II to the said regulations, the following Appendix shall be substituted, namely:-
“Appendix II
(See regulation 37)
Dearness relief on basic pension shall be as under :-

(1) In the case of employees who were in the workmen cadre and who retired on or after the 1* day of January,
1986, but before the 1* day of November, 1992; and in the case of employees who were in the officers’ cadre
and who retired on or after the 1% day of January, 1986, but before the ™ day of July, 1993, dearness relief
shall be payable for every rise or be recoverable for every fall, as the case may be, of every 4 points over 600
points in the quarterly average of the All India Average Consumer Price Index for Industrial Workers in the
series 1960 = 100. Such increase or decrease in dearness relief for every said four points shall be calculated in
the manner given below:-

Scale of basic pension The rate of dearness relief as a
per month percentage of basic pension
@ ()
@) UptoRs.1250 0.67 per cent
(i) Rs.1251 to Rs.2000 0.67 per cent 0fRs.1250 plus 0.55 per cent of basic
pension in excess of Rs.1250.
(i)  Rs.2001 to Rs.2130 0.67 per cent 0fRs.1250 plus 0.55 per cent of the

difference between Rs.2000 and Rs.1250 plus 0.33 per
cent of basic pension in excess of Rs.2000.

(iv) Above Rs.2130 0.67 percent of Rs.1250 plus 0.55 percent the difference
between Rs.2000 and Rs.1250 plus 0.33 per cent of the
difference between Rs.2130 and Rs.2000 plus 0.17 per
cent of basic pension in excess of Rs.2130.

(2) In the case of employees who are in workmen cadre and who retire on or after the 1 day of November, 1992;
and in the case of employees who are in the officers’ cadre and who retire on or after the 1% day of July, 1993,
dearness relief shall be payable for every rise or be recoverable for every fall, as the case may be, of every 4
points over 1148 points in the quarterly average of All India Average Consumer Price Index for Industrial
Workers

in the series 1960 = 100. Such increase or decrease in dearness relief for every said four points shall be
calculated in the manner given below :-



14

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

3

Scale of basic
pension per month

@

The rate of dearness relief as a
percentage of basic pension

2

i UptoRs.2400

(i1) Rs.2401 to Rs.3850

(i)  Rs.3851 to Rs.4100

(iv) above Rs.4100

0.35 per cent

0.35 percent 0ofRs.2400 plus 0.29percent
of basic pension in excess of Rs.2400

0.35 percent of Rs.2400 plus 0.29 percent

of the difference between Rs.3850 and Rs.2400 plus

0.17 percent of basic pension in excess of Rs.3850

0.35 per cent of Rs.2400 plus 0.29 per cent of the difference
between Rs.3850 and Rs.2400 plus 0.17 per cent of the
difference between Rs.4100 and Rs.3850 plus 0.09 per cent of
basic pension in excess of Rs.4100

In the case of employees who retire on or after the 1" day of April, 1998, dearness relief shall be
payable for every rise or be recoverable for every fall, as the case may be, of every 4 points over 1616
points in the quarterly average of the All India Average Consumer Price Index for Industrial Workers
in the series 1960=100. Such increase or decrease in dearness relief for every said four points shall be
calculated in the manner given below :-

Scale of basic
pension per month

The rate of dearness relief as a
percentage of basic pension

@) UptoRs.3380

(i1) Rs.3381 to Rs.5420

(iii))  Rs.5421 to Rs.5770

(iv)  Above Rs.5770

0.25 per cent

0.25 per cent of Rs.3380 plus 0.21 percent basic pension in
excess of Rs.3380

0.25 per cent of Rs.3380 plus 0.21 percent of the difference
between Rs.5420 and Rs.3380 plus 0.12 per cent of basic
pension in excess of Rs.5420.

0.25 per cent of Rs.3380 plus 0.21 percent of the difference
between Rs.5420 and Rs.3380 plus 0.12 per cent of the
difference between Rs.5770 andRs.5420 plus 0.06 per cent of
basic pension in excess of Rs.5770.

Provided that on or from the 1* day of May 2005 in the case of employees who retire on or after the 1%
day of April 1998 but on or before the 31* October 2002, dearness relief shall be payable for every rise or
be recoverable for every fall, as the case may be, of every 4 points over 1684 points in the quarterly
average of the All India Average Consumer Price Index for Industrial Workers in the series 1960=100.
Such increase or decrease in dearness relief for every said 4 points shall be calculated in the manner

given below:

Scale of basic pension
per month

The rate of dearness relief as a
percentage of basic pension

(1) UptoRs.3550

(i1) Rs.3551 to Rs.5650

(iii) Rs.5651 to Rs.6010

0.24 per cent

0.24 per cent of Rs.3550 plus 0.20 per cent basic pension in
excess of Rs.3550

0.24 per cent of Rs.3550 plus 0.20 per cent of the difference
between Rs.5650 andRs.3550 plus 0.12 of basic pension in
excess of Rs.5650



[9r HI—@rs 4] T =hT TSTIA @ STHTHROT 15

(iv) Above Rs.6010 0.24 per cent of Rs.3550 plus 0.20 per cent of the difference
between Rs.5650 andRs.3550 plus 0.12 per cent of the
difference between Rs.6010 and Rs.5650 plus 0.06 per cent
of basic pension in excess of Rs.6010

4) In respect of employees who retire on or after the 1* day of May, 2005, dearness relief shall be
payable for every rise or be recoverable for every fall, as the case may be, of every 4 points over 2288
points in the quarterly average of the All India Average Consumer Price Index for Industrial Workers
in the series 1960=100. Such increase or decrease in dearness relief for every said 4 points shall be
calculated at the rate of 0.18 per cent of basic pension:

Provided that on and from the 1* day of May 2005, in respect of employees who retired on or after 1*
day of November 2002 but on or before 30" day of April 2005, dearness relief shall be payable in
terms of this clause:

Provided further that in respect of employees who retired on or after the 1% day of November 2007,
Dearness Relief shall be payable for every rise or be recoverable for every fall, as the case may be, of
every 4 points over 2836 points in the quarterly average of the All India Average Consumer Price
Index for Industrial Workers in the series 1960=100. Such increase or decrease in dearness relief for
every said 4 points shall be calculated at the rate of 0.15 per cent of basic pension.

%) Dearness relief shall be payable for the half year commencing from the 1*day of February and ending
with the 31 day of July on the quarterly average of the index figures published for the months of
October, November and December of the previous year and for the half year commencing from the 1*
day of August and ending with the 31% day of January on the quarterly average of the index figures
published for the months of April, May and June of the same year.

6) In the case of family pension, invalid pension and compassionate allowance, dearness relief shall be
payable in accordance with the rates mentioned above.

7) Dearness relief will be allowed on full basic pension even after commutation.
®) Dearness relief is not payable on additional pension.
9 Pensioner whose basic pension is less than minimum pension but the aggregate of basic pension and

additional pension is more than the minimum pension shall draw dearness relief as applicable to
minimum pension.”.

10.  For Appendix III to the said regulations, the following Appendix shall be substituted, namely :-

“Appendix IIT
(See Regulation 39)
The ordinary rates of family pension shall be as under:-
(a) In respect of employees other than part-time employees, where the employee was in the workmen

cadre and retired before the 1* day of November, 1992 or where the employee was in the officers’
cadre and retired before the 1* day of July, 1993:-

Scale of pay per month Amount of monthly Family pension
@ @
UptoRs.1500 30 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 30

per cent of allowances which are counted for making
contributions to Provident Fund but not for dearness allowance
shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of basic and
additional family pension shall not be less than Rs.375 per month.

Rs.1501 to Rs.3000 20 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 20
percent of allowances which are counted for making contributions
to Provident Fund but not dearness allowance shall be the
additional family pension.The aggregate of basic and additional
family pension shall not be less than Rs.450 per month.

Above Rs.3000 15 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 15
per cent of allowances which are counted for making
contributions to Provident Fund but not for dearness allowance
shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of basic and



16

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

additional family pension shall not be less than Rs.600 per month
and not more than Rs.1250 per month.

(b) In respect of employees other than part-time employees, where the employee was in the workmen
cadre and retired on or after the 1* day of November, 1992 or where the employee was in the officers’
cadre and retired on or after the 1* day of July 1993:-

Scale of pay per month Amount of monthly Family Pension

(D 2)

UptoRs.2870 30 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 30
per cent of allowances which are counted for making
contributions to Provident Fund but not for dearness allowance
shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of basic and
additional family pension shall be subject to a minimum of Rs.720
per month.

Rs.2871 to Rs.5740 20 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 20
per cent of allowances which are counted for making
contributions to Provident Fund but not for dearness allowance
shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of basic and
additional family pension shall be subject to a minimum of Rs.860
per month.

Above Rs.5740 15 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 15
per cent of allowances which are counted for making
contributions to Provident Fund but not for dearness allowance
shall be theadditional family pension. The aggregate of basic and
additional family pension shall be subject to a minimum of
Rs.1150 per month and a maximum of Rs.2400 per month.

(c) In respect of employees (both officers and workmen) other than part-time employees retiring on or
after the 1% day of April, 1998: -

Scale of pay per month Amount of monthly Family Pension

€)) (©))
UptoRs.4040 30 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 30

per cent of allowances which are counted for making
contributions to Provident Fund but not for dearness allowance
shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of basic and
additional family pension shall not be less than Rs.1015 per
month.

Rs.4041 to Rs.8080 20 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 20
per cent of allowances which are counted for making
contributions to Provident Fund but not for dearness allowance
shall be the additional family pension. The aggregate of basic and
additional family pension shall not be less than Rs.1212 per
month.

Above Rs.8080 15 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 15
per cent of allowances which are counted for making contributions
to Provident Fund but not for dearness allowance shall be the
additional family pension. The aggregate of basic and additional
family pension shall not be less than Rs.1616 per month and a
maximum ofRs.3378 per month:



[9r HI—@rs 4] T =hT TSTIA @ STHTHROT 17

(d) In respect of employees (both officers and workmen) other than part-time employees retiring on or after
the 1% day of the May 2005:-

cale of pay per month Amount of monthly Family Pension
1) @)
UptoRs.5720 30 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus

30 per cent of allowance which are counted for making
contribution to Provident Fund but not for dearness
allowance, shall be the additional family pension. The
aggregate of basic and additional family pension shall be
subject to a minimum of Rs.1435 p.m.

Rs.5721 to Rs.11440 20 per cent of the Pay shall be basic family pension plus 20
per cent of allowance which are counted for making
contributions to Provident Fund but not for dearness
allowance, shall be the additional family pension. The
aggregate of basic and additional family pension shall be
subject to minimum of Rs.1715 p.m.

Above Rs.11440 15 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus
15 per cent of allowances which are counted for making
contributions to Provident Fund but not for the dearness
allowance, shall be the additional family pension. The
aggregate of basic and additional family pension shall be
subject to a minimum of Rs.2292 p.m. and maximum of
Rs.4784 p.m.:

Provided that on and from the 1* day of May 2005, in respect of employees who retired on or after the 1*
day of November 2002 but on or before the 30" April 2005, ordinary rates of family pension shall be in
terms of this clause.

(e) In respect of employees (both officers and workmen) other than part-time employees retiring on or after
the 1* day of November 2007:-

Scale of pay per month Amount of monthly Family Pension
(D (©))
UptoRs.7090 30 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 30 per

cent of allowance which are counted for making contribution to
Provident Fund but not for dearness allowance, shall be the
additional family pension. The aggregate of basic and additional
family pension shall be subject to a minimum of Rs.1779 p.m.

Rs.7091 to Rs.14180 20 per cent of the Pay shall be basic family pension plus 20 per cent
of allowance which are counted for making contributions to
Provident Fund but not for dearness allowance, shall be the
additional family pension. The aggregate of basic and additional
family pension shall be subject to minimum of Rs.2186 p.m.

Above Rs.14180 15 per cent of the Pay shall be the basic family pension plus 15 per
cent of allowances which are counted for making contributions to
Provident Fund but not for the dearness allowance, shall be the
additional family pension. The aggregate of basic and additional
family pension shall be subject to a minimum of Rs.2841 p.m. and
maximum of Rs.5930 p.m.




18

THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART III—SEC. 4]

Notes :-

()]
(@)

3

“

Dearness relief is not payable on additional family pension.

Scale of pay for the purpose of calculation of family pension as above shall be the aggregate
of Pay as defined in clause (s) of regulation 2 and allowances as defined in the Explanation to
sub-regulation (3) of regulation 35.

In the case of a part-time employee, the minimum amount of family pension and maximum
amount of family pension shall be in proportion to the rate of scale wages drawn by the
employee.

In case the aggregate of basic family pension and additional family pension falls short of
minimum pension the pensioner may be given minimum family pension and dearness relief
may be paid on such minimum family pension. However, no additional family pension
shall be payable over and above the minimum family pension.”.

EXPLANATORY MEMORANDUM

The Regulations which have been given retrospective effect are as per the agreed terms and conditions of the
settlements and Joint Notes signed between the Indian Banks’ Association on behalf of member banks on the
basis of specific mandate given by the respective banks in this regard and apex level workmen unions and
officers’ associations of the Banks. Therefore, interests of no person shall be adversely affected by such

retrospective effect.

B. ASHOK, General Manager

[ADVT III/4/Exty./236/17]

Note: The principal regulations were published on 29.09.1995 and subsequently amended vide following notifications
published in Part III, Section 4 of the Gazette of India, namely:—

No.25, dated the 21st , day of June, 2003
No.42, dated the 16th , day of October, 2004
No.67, dated the 21st , day of March, 2012
No.21, dated the 24th, day of May, 2014

Rl el

Digitally signed by RAKESH

RAKESH SUKUL suxu

Date: 2017.09.21 20:01:48 +05'30'

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054.



		2017-09-21T20:01:48+0530
	RAKESH SUKUL




